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Veterans Day Events: The National Veterans Day 

Observance at Arlington National Cemetery will be 
held on Nov. 11, at 11 a.m. The public is invited to 
attend. Read more for details and updates. At 1 p.m., 

the Vietnam Veterans Memorial Fund will host a 
special observance and 40th anniversary event at 
The Wall. Read more.  

 
 
 

 

 

Veterans Day Discounts and Freebies: As a 
display of gratitude and appreciation, community 

partners have joined together for Veterans Day, Nov. 
11, to honor service members, veterans, and their 
families for their sacrifice and dedication to our 
nation. Participating Sport Clips locations will be 

offering free haircuts to active duty service members 
and veterans. Other Veterans Day discounts are 
being offered for a variety of restaurants, retailers, 

and services. 
 
 

 

VFW’s “Sport Clips Help A Hero Scholarship” 
Closing Soon: Scholarship applications for the 
spring 2023 semester will be accepted through Nov. 

15. Veterans can face many challenges while 
furthering their education. Let Sport Clips and the 
VFW help you succeed in reaching your education 

goals. This scholarship can help ease the financial 
burden by providing up to $5,000 of assistance per 
semester, per family, for service members and 

veterans in the rank of E-5 and below. Apply now. 
 
 

https://www.arlingtoncemetery.mil/Visit/Events-and-Ceremonies#/
https://www.vvmf.org/veteransday2022/
https://www.sportclips.com/promotions-partnerships/help-a-hero/help-a-hero-2022
https://news.va.gov/109711/veterans-day-discounts-free-meals/?utm_source=events&utm_medium=email&utm_campaign=VetResources&utm_id=01NOV2022
https://www.vfw.org/studentveteran


 

National Family Caregivers Month: VA is honoring 
the estimated 5.5 million family members and friends 

who provide much-needed care for chronically ill, 
injured, or disabled veterans during National Family 
Caregivers Month. Resources for caregivers have 

significantly increased since the passage of the VFW-
supported VA Mission Act of 2018. The VA Caregiver 
Support Program offers tools and information for 

caregivers and the veterans they serve. Additionally, 
Building Better Caregivers provides an online 
workshop with self-paced lessons and a connection 

with the caregiver community. Learn more. 
 
 

 

MIA Update: The Defense POW/MIA Accounting 
Agency announced two burial updates and four new 
identifications for service members who have been 

missing and unaccounted-for from World War II, 
Korea, and Vietnam. Returning home for burial with 
full military honors are: 

-- Army Air Forces Cpl. Merle L. Pickup, 27, of 
Provo, Utah, was assigned to 308th Bombardment 
Group, 373rd Bombardment Squadron, stationed in 

Yangkai, China. In May 1944, he was a passenger on 
board a B-24J Liberator bomber on a ferrying mission 
from China to Chabua, Assam, India. The plane 

never reached its destination after encountering bad 
weather, and the Army reported the plane as missing. 
Pickup will be buried in his hometown on Dec.17, 

2022. Read about Pickup. 
-- Army Staff Sgt. Sanford I. Finger, 29, of Miami 
Beach, Florida, was assigned to U.S. Army Element 

Vietnam, Army Air Force Regional Exchange, Pacific 
Exchange, U.S. Army Headquarters Area Command. 
On Oct. 26, 1971, Finger was lost when the CH-47B 

Chinook helicopter on which he was a passenger 
went down over water in bad weather while flying 
from Tuy Hoa to Cam Ranh Bay Vietnam. He was not 

accounted for during search and rescue operations. 
His burial date and location have yet to be 
determined. Read about Finger. 

-- Army Sgt. Howard G. Malcolm, 23, was assigned 
to Headquarters Company, 9th Infantry Regiment, 
2nd Infantry Division. He was reported missing in 

action on Dec. 1, 1950, after his unit’s withdrawal 
from Kunu-ri, North Korea. Later findings indicated 
that Malcolm had been a prisoner of war and died at 

POW Camp #5 in August 1951. Interment services 
are pending. Read about Malcolm. 

https://www.caregiver.va.gov/
https://www.caregiver.va.gov/
https://va.buildingbettercaregivers.org/
https://www.caregiver.va.gov/NFCM.asp
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3114036/airman-accounted-for-from-world-war-ii-pickup-m/
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3138077/soldier-accounted-for-from-vietnam-war-finger-s/
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3201485/soldier-accounted-for-from-korean-war-malcolm-h/


-- Army Sgt. Allen H. Tuttle, 23, was assigned to 
Battery C, 38th Field Artillery Battalion, 2nd Infantry 

Division, 8th U.S. Army. He was reported missing in 
action on Dec. 2, 1950, after his unit’s attempted 
withdrawal from Kunu-ri, North Korea, following the 

battle of Ch’ongch’on. Later findings indicated that 
Tuttle had been a prisoner of war and died at POW 
Camp #5 in March 1951. Interment services are 

pending. Read about Tuttle. 
-- Army Air Forces Tech. Sgt. James M. Triplett, 
36, was assigned to 700th Bombardment Squadron, 

445th Bombardment Group, 2nd Air Division, 8th Air 
Force. On Sept. 27, 1944, the B-24H Liberator aircraft 
on which Triplett was serving as a radio operator 

crashed as a result of enemy fire during a bombing 
mission near Kassel, Germany. His body was unable 
to be recovered and the Germans never reported him 

as a prisoner of war. A finding of death was issued by 
the War Department on Sept. 28, 1945. Interment 
services are pending. Read about Triplett. 

-- Army Air Force Pvt. John W. Ropp, 31, was 
assigned to the 2nd Observance Squadron in the 
Philippines, when Japanese forces invaded the 

Philippine Islands in December 1941. Intense fighting 
continued until the surrender of the Bataan peninsula 
in April 1942. Ropp was among those captured and 

held at the Cabanatuan POW Camp where he 
reportedly died on July 28, 1942, and was buried. 
Interment services are pending. Read about Ropp. 

 
 
 

 
 
 

Click here to view this week’s edition. 
 

Click here for past editions of the VFW Action Corps Weekly. 

 
Click here to sign up new veterans’ advocates. 

 

As always, we want to hear your advocacy stories. To share your stories or photos with us, simply email 
them directly to vfwac@vfw.org. 

 

 

https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3205089/soldier-accounted-for-from-korean-war-tuttle-a/
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3205218/airman-accounted-for-from-wwii-triplett-j/
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3206162/airman-accounted-for-from-wwii-ropp-j/
https://www.vfw.org/advocacy/grassroots-efforts/vfw-action-corps-weekly
https://www.vfw.org/actioncorpsweeklyarchive
https://votervoice.net/VFW/register
mailto:vfwac@vfw.org

