
 

 

May 1, 2023 

 

 

 

VFW Letter to Speaker McCarthy Urging Veteran 

Protections: The House passed a budget resolution 
to reduce the amount of federal spending for the next 
fiscal year (FY). The resolution sets overall spending 

at 2022 levels, but does not specify that veteran care 
and benefits would not be reduced. VFW Washington 
Office Executive Director Ryan Gallucci sent a letter 

to Speaker of the House Kevin McCarthy urging him 
to ensure protections for veterans are addressed. 
Gallucci wrote, “Plainly stated, the Honoring our 

PACT Act of 2022 did not exist when funding levels 
were set for FY 2022.” The PACT Act was not passed 
into law until after budget levels had been 

established, so the VFW wants to ensure the 
monumental advances secured through that 
legislation are protected.  Read the letter.   
 

 

 

Veteran Benefits Bill Hearing: The Senate 
Committee on Veterans’ Affairs held a pending 

legislation hearing to discuss 14 bills on veteran and 
survivor benefits. VFW National Legislative Deputy 
Director Kristina Keenan provided a statement for the 

record in support of these proposals. In particular, 
she conveyed the VFW’s strong support of the 
GUARD VA Benefits Act of 2023, which would 

reinstate criminal and financial penalties for 
unaccredited representatives who prey on veterans. 
Read the testimony or  watch the hearing that begins 

at the 11:48 mark.   
 
 

https://www.vfw.org/media-and-events/latest-releases/archives/2023/4/vfw-asks-speaker-of-the-house-to-honor-the-promises-of-the-pact-act
https://www.vfw.org/advocacy/national-legislative-service/congressional-testimony/2023/4/pending-legislation
https://www.veterans.senate.gov/2023/4/hearing-to-consider-pending-legislation


 

VA Online Financial Literacy Seminars: The VA 
Office of Outreach, Transition and Economic 

Development has partnered with Prudential to host 
free monthly online financial literacy seminars for 
veterans, transitioning service members, spouses, 

family members, and caregivers. Income 
management topics include budgeting, saving, 
investing, taxes, life insurance, and preparing for 

retirement. Register for a session.   
 
 

  

 

MIA Update: The Defense POW/MIA Accounting 

Agency announced two burial updates for service 
members who have been missing and unaccounted-
for from WWII and Korea. Returning home for burial 

with full military honors are: 
--Army Cpl. Luther H. Story, 19, of Americus, 
Georgia, was a member of Alpha Company, 1st 

Battalion, 9th Infantry Regiment, 2nd Infantry 
Division. He was reported killed in action on Sept. 1, 
1950, and was posthumously awarded the Medal of 

Honor. He will be buried in Andersonville, Georgia, on 
May 29, 2023. Read about Story. 
--Army Air Forces Staff Sgt. Ralph D. Kolb, 19, of 

McGehee, Arkansas, was assigned to the 343rd 
Bombardment Squadron, 98th Bombardment Group, 
9th Air Force. On Aug. 1, 1943, the B-24 Liberator 

bomber on which he was the assistant radio operator 
was hit by enemy anti-aircraft fire and crashed during 
Operation Tidal Wave. He will be buried in his 

hometown on June 14, 2023. Read about Kolb. 
 
 

 

Click here to view this week’s edition. 

 
Click here for past editions of the VFW Action Corps Weekly. 

 

Click here to sign up new veterans’ advocates. 
 

As always, we want to hear your advocacy stories. To share your stories or photos with us, simply email 

them directly to vfwac@vfw.org. 

 

https://www.cvent.com/c/calendar/a66e4100-024f-4394-b9c8-1eb784a40434
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3374478/medal-of-honor-soldier-accounted-for-from-korea-story-l/
https://www.dpaa.mil/News-Stories/News-Releases/PressReleaseArticleView/Article/3165336/airman-accounted-for-from-world-war-ii-kolb-r/
https://www.vfw.org/advocacy/grassroots-efforts/vfw-action-corps-weekly
https://www.vfw.org/actioncorpsweeklyarchive
https://votervoice.net/VFW/register
mailto:vfwac@vfw.org

